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SUBJECT: Approval to award a two year contract for fuel to Petroleum Traders and RKA
Petroleum for Truck Transport (over 5,000 gallons) and Atlas Oil for Tank Wagon (under
5,000 gallons) through the Michigan Intergovernmental Trade Network (MITN) cooperative
purchasing bid for an estimated annual amount of $ 365,000.

SUBMITTING DEPARTMENT: Finance/DPS
7

CITY MANAGER APPROVAI,:/ / %‘W‘M
EXPENDITURE REQUIRED $ 365,000
AMOUNT BUDGETED $ 387,000
APPROPRIATION REQUIRED N/A
LINE ITEM NUMBER 101-442.30-861.000 (Note: Aliocated to other
funds/depts. based on gas-boy reporting)

BACKGROUND INFORMATION:

The City of Novi purchases approximately 99,000 gallons of gasoline and 36,700 gallons of
diesel per year {(based on usage in the last 12 months) to fuel the City's fleet of
automobiles, trucks, equipment, and generators. The City of Novi makes truck transport
purchases (over 5,000 gallons) for the DPS fuel tanks and may use tank wagon purchases
(less than 5,000 gallons) to fill generator tanks at lift stations & booster stations.

Sterling Heights posted a bid for the fuel contract on behalf of 18 MITN member
communities, including the City of Novi. The contract is a two year contract effective
February 1, 2012 with one fwo-year renewal option. They received six qualified bids which
were reviewed and evaluated. Sterling Heights has awarded the truck transport portion
to two firms (Petroleum Traders and RKA Petfroleum) and the tank wagon portion to Atlas
Oil Company.

We pay for fuel based on the per gallon wholesale rack average as published daily by the
Qil Price Information Service (OPIS) plus a delivery fee (bid factor) per gallon. The City of
Novi uses Unleaded Regular Gasoline and ULS Diesel #2. To leverage this award for our
best advantage, we will purchase the gasoline from Petroleum Traders and the diesel from
RKA Petroleum. See attached Bid Tabulation.

The three local school districts (Novi Community School District, Northville Schools, and
Walled Lake Consolidated Schools) would be dllowed to parficipate in this bid if they are
members of MITN. At this time, Walled Lake Consolidated Schools is the only district that
has become a member.

The Library Network (TLN), a consortium of 65 libraries in Southeast Michigan, has expressed
an interest in using the fuel station at DPS to fuel their delivery vehicles. In order for the



City to provide their fuel, TLN must provide us a “Certificate For State Use or Non-Profit
Educational Use"” which indicates that their organization meets the definition of a state or

local government or a hon-profit educational organization. We are waiting for them to
provide this certificate.

RECOMMENDED ACTION: Approval to award a two year contract for fuel to Petroleum Traders
and RKA Petroleum for Truck Transport (over 5,000 gallons) and Atlas Oil for Tank Wagon
(under 5,000 gallons) through the Michigan Intergovernmental Trade Network (MITN)
cooperative purchasing bid for an estimated annual amount of $ 365,000.

1/2/Y| N 12 |Y|N
Mayor Gatt Council Member Margolis
Mayor Pro Tem Staudt Council Member Muich
Council Member Casey Council Member Wrobel
Council Member Fischer




CITY OF STERLING HEIGHTS

BID TABULATION - NOVEMBER 1, 2011

ITB-SH11-035: TRUCK TRANSPORT AND TANK WAGON
DELIERIES OF UNLEADED GASOLINE, AND DIESEL FUE

TRUCK TRANSPORT
Petroleum Traders Corp RKA Petroleum Companies Mansfield Oil Company

ftem Est Gal Rack Avg __Eacfor Pricelgal Ext Total Factor Price/gal Ext Tatal Factor Price/gal Ext Tatal
Unleaded Regular 2,505,000 | 2.6801 +.0078 2.6879 $6,733,189.50 +.0102 2.6903 $6,739,201.50 +.0244 2.7045 $6,774,772.50
Unleaded Mid-Grade 434,000 2.7486 +.0030 2.7516 $1,194,194.40 +.0210 2.7696 $1,202,006.40 +.0307 27793 $1,206.21620
ULS Premium Diesel #2 | 428,000 3.2108 +.0307 3.2415 $1,387,362.00 3.2308 $1,382,782.40 -.0002 3.2106 $1 374,136.80
ULS Diesel #2 657,000 31721 +.0107 3.1828 $2,091,099.60 3.‘1 748 $2,085,843.60 +.0068 3.1789 $2,088,537.30

Totals $11,405,845.50 $11,409,833.90 $11,443,662.30
Other Fuels .
Unleaded Premium 1,000 2.8994 +0025 29019 $2,901.80 +0363 29357 $2,935.70 +.0379 29373 $2,937.30
ULS Diesel #1 1,000 3.4232 +.0168 3.4400 $3,440.00 +.0168 3.4400 $3,440.00 +.0071 3.4303 $3,430.30
Biodiesel B-5 {Optional) 1,000 31915 +.0431 3.2346 $3.234.60 +.0167 3.2082 $3,208.20 NB N/B N/B
Biodiesel B-10 (Optional) 1,000 3.2334 +.0431 3.2617 $3,261.70 -.0027 3.2307 $3,230.70 N/B N/B N/B
Blodiesel B-20 (Optional) 1,000 3.0979 +.0431 3.2137 $3,213.70 -0198 . 3.0781 $3,078.10 N/B N/B N/B
E85 Ethanol (Optionat) .~ 1,000 2.9165 +.0283 3.2137 $3,213.70 Avaii on Req. N/B N/B N/B

Totals $11,425,111.10 $11,425,726.60 $11,450,030.40
Short load charge $50.00 $50.00 $65.00
Volume, SE MI 3,178,000 99,331,483 10,000,000
Terms Net 30-No Discount/ Net 10 =.005/gal discount | Net 30-No Discount/ Net 15 = .005/gal discount net 30
Split order charge ~ $40.00 $35.00 $35.00
Accept Purchasing Card Yes - 4.5% Processing Fee Yes - 3% processing fee No
* Averages were adjusted to maintaln continuity and ta obtaln a fair comparison price. Some totals may have changed. Addltional totals were added hy Purchasing to break out optional tems.
0:\Bid Tabulatian\Gasofine 2012-14 [TB-SH11.035 Page 1 of 2




CITY OF STERLING HEIGHTS

BID TABULATION - NOVEMBER 1, 2011

ITB-SH11-035: TRUCK TRANSPORT AND TANK WAGON
DELIVERIES OF UNLEADED GASOLINE, AND DIESEL FUEL

TRUCK TRANSPORT
] Atlas Oil Company Spencer Oil Company Michigan Fuels, inc.

ftem Est Gal Razck Avg Factor Price/gal Ext Total Factor Price/gal Ext Total Factor Price/gal Ext Totaf
Unleaded Regular 2,505,000 2.6801 +.0235 270386 $6,772,518.00 +.03646 2.7186 $6,804,982.80 +.0300 2.7101 $6,788,800.50
Unleaded Mid-Grade 434,000 2.7486 +.0235 2.7721 $1,203,091.40 | +.03646 2.7851 $1,208,716.04 N/B N/B N/B
ULS Premium Diesel #2 428,000 | 3.2108 +.0259 3.2396 $1,386,548.80 +.03665 3.2475 $1,389,908.60 +.0300 3.2408 $1,387,062.40
ULS Diesel #2 657,000 i 34721 +.0259 3.2703 $2,148,587.10 +.03665 3.2088 $2,108,148.75 +.0300 3.2021 $2,103,779.70

Totals $11,510,745.30 $11,511,756.18 $10,279,642.60
Qther Fuels
Unleaded Premium 1,000 2.8994 +.0000 2.8994 $2,899.40 +.03646 2.9359 $2,935.86 N/B N/B N/B
ULS Diesel #1 1,000 34232 +.0000 3.5048 $3,504.80 +.03665 3.4599 $3,459.85 +.0300 3.4532 $3,453.20
Biodiesel B-5 (Optional) 1,000 3.1915 +.0000 3.1915 $3,191.50 N/B N/B N/B N/B N/B N/B
Biodiesel B-10 (Optional) 1,000 3.2334 +.0000 3.2334 $3,233.40 N/B N/B N/B N/B N/B N/B
Blodiesel B-20 (Optional) 1,000 3.0978 +.0000 3.0979 $3,097.90 N/B N/B N/B N/B N/B N/B
EBS Ethanol (Optional) 1,006 2.9165 +.0000 NB N/B +.04475 296125 $2,961.25 N/B N/B N/B

Tofals $11,526,672.30 $11,521,113.15 $10,283,055.80

Short load charge $35.00 none $35.00
Volume, SE MI 200,000,000 40,000,000 200,000,000
Terms . net 30 net 30 net 30
Split order charge $35.00 None $35.00
Accept Purchasing Card N/A No No

* Averages were adjusted to malntain continuity and fo obialn a fair comparison price. Some totals may have changed. Additicnal totals were added by Purchasing to break out oplional items.

0:Bld Tabulation\Gasoline 2012-14 ITB-SH11-035
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CITY OF STERLING HEIGHTS
BID TABULATION - NOVEMBER 1, 2011

ITB-SH11-035 TRUCK TRANSPORT AND TANK WAGON
DELIVERIES OF UNLEADED GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUEL

TANK WAGQN '
Atlas Oil Compa;y Spencer Oil Company
ltem Est Gal Rack Avg Factor Price/gal Ext Fotal Factor Price/gal Ext Totaf
Unleaded Regular 47,500 2.6801 +.1100 2.7901 $132,529.75 +,11646 2.79656 $132,836.60
Unleaded Mid-Grade 40,000 2.7486 +.1100 2.8586 $114,344.00 +.11646 2.86506 $114,602.40
ULS Premium Diesel #2 22,500 32108 +.1 10 33208 $74,718.00 +.11665 3.32745 . $74,867.63
;?4 ULS Diesel #2 77,000 31721 3.2821 $252,721.70 | +.11665 328875 $253,233.78
ULS Digsel #2 - Dyed 39,500 3.1801 +.1100 3.2901 $129,958.95 +.11665 ' 3.29675 $130,221.63
uULsS Diesel #1 - Dyed 200 3.42382 +.0000 3.4282 $685.64 N/B
Totals $704,858.04 $705,762.00
Biodiesel B-5 (Optional) 1,000 3.1915 +.0000 3.1815 $3,191.50 N/B N/B N/B
Biodiesel B-10 (Optional) 1,000 | 3.2334 +.0000 3.2334 $3,233.40 N/B . N/B N/B
Blodiesel B-20 (Optional) 1,000 3.0879 +.0000 3.0979 $3,097.90 N/B N/B N/B
E85 Ethanol (Opfional) 1,000 2.9165 N/B +16475 3.08125 $3,081.25
Grand Total $714.480.84 $708,843.25
Minimum delivery qty. 200 gzllons ' 250 gallons
Volume, SE M 200,000,000 40,000,000
Terms Net 30 - net 3¢
Split order charge . $35.00 None
Accept Purchasing Card No No

No Tank Wagon Bids: Mansfield Oil & Petroleum Traders

* Averages wert adjustad fo maintain eontinuity and to obtain a fair comparison price. Some Intals may have changed. Addtional fotals were added by Purchasing o break out oplional items.

0:\Bid Tabulstion\Gasoline 2012-14 ITB-SH11-035 Page 10of 2



CITY OF STERLING HEIGHTS
BID TABULATION - NOVEMBER 1, 2011

ITB-SH11-035 TRUCK TRANSPORT AND TANK WAGON
DELIVERIES OF UNLEADED GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUEL

_TANK WAGON _
RKA Petroleum Companies Michigan Fuels, inc.
Hem Est Gal Rack Avg Factor Price/gal Ext Total Factor Price/gal Ext Total
Unleaded Regular 47,500 2.6801 ' +.1195 2.79980 $132,981.00 +.0700 2.7501 $130,629.75
Unleaded Mid-Grade 40,000 2.7486 +1195 2.86810 $114,724.00 N/B
ULS Premium Diesel #2 22,500 3.2108 +.1195 3.33030 $74,931.75 +.0700 3.2808 $73,818.00
ULS Diesel #2 77,000 34721 +.1195 3.29160 $253,453.20 +.0700 3.2421 $249,641.70
ULS Diesel #2 - Dyed 39,500 3.1 8o1 +.1195 3.29960 $130,334.20 +.0700 3.2501 $128,378.95
ULS Diesel #1 - Dyed 200 3.4282 +.1975 3.62570 $725.14 +.0700 - 3.4982 $699.64
Totals $707,149.29 $583,168.04

Biodiesel B-5 {(Optional) 1,000 34915 | +1310 3.32250 $3,322.50 N/B ' N/B N/B
Biodiesel B-10 (Optional) 1,000 3.2334 +1115 3.34400 $3,344.90 N/B N/B N/B
Biodlesel B-20 (Optional}) 1,000 3.0979 +.0960 3.1939 $3,193.90 N/B N/B N/B
E85 Ethanol (Optional} 1,000 29165 |Availon Req. v N/B N/B N/B

Grand Total $717,016.59 $583,168.04
Minimum delivery qty. 150 gallons. If Under 150 gals. = $100 charge 1,000 gzllons
Voiume, SE M! 99,331,483 200,000,000 +
Terms Net 30-No Discount Net 15 = .005/gal discount Net 30
Split order charge $35.00 ' $35.00
Accept Purchasing Card Yes - 3% Pmceséing Fee No

No Tank Wagon Bids: Mansfield Oil & Pefroleum Traders

* Averages were adjusted to maintain confinulty and to obtain a fair comparlson price. Some tolals may have changed. Additional totals were added by Purchasing fo break out optional items.

0:\Bid Tabulaflon\Gasoline 2012-14 ITB-3H11-035 . Page2of2



Business of the City Council ity Claks U
Sterling Heights, Michigan hmz No:

Meeting: 12:06/11

AGENDA STATEMENT

OMB AS03 Rev. 11,04

Item Title: To split the award of a bid for truck transport and tank wagon deliveries of gasoline and diesel fuel at
unit prices bid for a two-year period (Annual estimated cost of $790,000).

Submitted By: Office of Purchasing

Me-
Contact Person/Telephone: Mark Carufel, Purchasing / Risk Manager, 446-2741
—  City Clerk - — Resolution e Minutes
—_ Finance & Budget Director —_ Ordinance — PlarvMap
. City Attorney (as to Jegal form) — Contract —_ Other
— City Manager ‘

[0 Check bax if this agenda item requires billing/revenue collection (fees, etc.) by Treasury Office

Execufive Summary:

e The City of Sterling Heights purchases approximately 225,000 gallons of gasoline and 100,000 gallons diesel
fuel per year to power the City’s fleet of automobiles, trucks, equipment and generators. The City is also the
host community for a Michigan Intergovernmental Trade Network (MITN) cooperative bid for the purchase
of gasoline and diesel fuel that includes 18 member communities in the Macomb, Oakland and Wayne
County region. Through this cooperative bid, approximately three million gallons of gasoline and one million
gallons of diesel fuel are purchased annually. The current pricing expires on February 1, 2012,

e The bid is structured so that MITN members pay for fuel based on the per gallon wholesale rack average as
published daily by the Oil Price Information Service (OPIS), plus a delivery fee (bid factor) per gallon.
Gasoline and diesel fuel are purchased and delivered by truck transport for quantities of fuel greater than
5,000 gallons, and by tank wagon for quantities less than 5,000 gallons. On November 1, 2011, six bids were
recelved for the cooperative purchase of truck transport and tank Wagon deliveries of gasoline and diesel fuel
for a two-year period.

e Upon receipt and review of all bids, recommendation is being made to split the award of the bid among three
bidders. For the truck transport portion of the bid, the recommendation is to award the bid to Petroleum
Traders, Inc. and to RKA Petroleum, Inc, the two low bidders meeting bid specifications. As more fully
explained in the attached Staff Report, by awarding to these two low bidders, participating cooperative
members will be able to leverage favorable pricing based upon the type and quantity of fuel being purchased.
For the tank wagon portion of the bid, recommendation is being made to award the bid to Atlas Oil, the low
bidder meeting bid specifications.



@

Prices charged to MITN members are considerably lower than prices consumers pay at the pumps. MITN
members are purchasing gasoline and diesel fuel at wholesale pricing, which changes daily just like consumer
pricing at the local gas station. Below is a breakdown of pricing per gallon for truck transport and tank wagon
deliveries of fuel. Wholesale pricing was based on the OPIS Detroit Rack Average on November 22, 2011;

Trnek Transport
Bid Factor
OPIS Price  Delivery Fees State & Federal Total Delivered
Fuel Type per Gallon per Gallan. Fees per Gallon Price per Gallan
Unleaded Reg. Gasoline  $2.5196 $0.0078 Included $2.5274
(Petroleum Traders) Comparative Consumer Retail Price on 11/22/11: $3.0500
ULS Diesel #2 $3.0953 $0.0027 Included $3.0980
(RKA Petroleum) Comparative Consumer Retail Price on 11/22/11: $3.9900
Tank Wagon
Bid Factor
OPIS Price  Delivery Fees  State & Federal Total Delivered
Fuel Type per Gallon per Gallon Eees per Gallon Price per Gallon
Unleaded Reg. Gasoline $2.5196 $0.1100 Included $2.6296
(Atlas Oil) Comparative Consumer Retail Price on 11/22/11:$3.0500
ULS Diesel #2 $3.0953 $0.1100 Included $3.2053
(Atlas Oil) Comparative Consumer Retail Price on 11/22/11:33,9900

Prices charged to MITN members through the cooperative bid will fluctuate based on market conditions, but
are considerably lower than the consumer pump prices as evidenced in the above examples. Qualifying
governmental entities are tax exempt, however, certain state and federal fees are payable, at approximately
$0.01165 per gallon.

RKA is the incumbent tank wagon vendor and their performance has been very good. RKA is also a current
vendor for the State of Michigan, Atlas Qil has prior experience with this cooperative bid having been a
successful bidder/vendor from 2003 to 2007. Atlas Oil performed well during this period, Petroleum Traders
is the largest independent distributor of gasoline and diesel fuel in the country. They use local vendors, such
as RKA and Atlas, to deliver on their behalf References were checked with all three vendors and proved
acceptable.

As the lead municipality, the MITN cooperative members rely upon the recommendation of the city of
Sterling Heights in awarding this bid. After this bid award by the city of Sterling Heights, the remaining 17
MITN cooperative members will purchase gasoline and diesel fuel using the bid pricing secured through this
cooperative bid.

Please see the attached Staff Report and supporting documentation for additional information.



Suggested Action:
MOVED BY: SECONDED BY:
RESOLVED, to split the award of the bid for truck transport and tank wagon deliveries of unleaded gasoline and

diesel fuel to the following vendors based on bid factors included in their respective bids for a two-year petiod,
with the option to extend the terms and conditions an additional two years upon mutual consent:

‘1. Petroleum Traders, Inc., 7120 Pointe Inverness Way, Fort Wayne, IN 46804
2. RKA Petroleun Companies, 28340 Wick Rd., Romulus, MI, 43174

1. Atlas Oil Company, 24501 Ecorse Rd., Taylor, M, 48180



CITY OF STERLING HEIGHTS
STAFF REPORT
December 6, 2011

Prepared By: Mark Carufel, Purchasing/Risk Manager Ext. No. 2741

GENERAL INFORMATION:

On November 1, 2011, bids were received in response to a MITN cooperative bid solicitation for
the delivery of gasoline and diesel fuel. Invitations to Bid were advertised on SHTV, posted to
the MITN website and published in the Source newspaper — Sterling Heights edition. Seven
vendors responded with bids as outlined on the attached bid tabulation. One bid was rejected for
faiture to include the required bid bond, leaving six qualifying bids. Funds for the purchase of
gasoline and diesel fuels are budgeted in Account #11717553-750000 (Fleet Maintenance - Fuels
and Lubricants). It is estimated that the City of Sterling Heights will expend approximately
$790,000 for truck transport and tank wagon deliveries annually.

STAFF ANALYSIS AND FINDINGS:

Upon review and analysis of all qualifying bids received, the recommendation is bemg made to split
the award of the bid among three vendors per the following analysis;

* Recommendation is being made to
award truck transport to the two overall low bidders, Petroleum Traders and RKA Petroleum,

Petrolenm Traders is the low bidder overall. Its regular unleaded (10% ethanol) gasoline factor of
$0.0078 is 66% lower than the incumbent Mansfield. The unleaded midgrade (10% ethanol) bid
factor of $0.0030 is 25% lower than the incumbent Mansfield’s expiring pricing. Howevet,
Petroleumn Traders diesel fuel bid factor pricing is not as low as RKA Petroleum's pricing. RKA's
bid factor pricing for ULS Premium Diesel #2 is 49% lower than the incumbent Mansfield, and
the ULS Diesel #2 is 86% lower. Therefore, the Office of Purchasing is recommending an award
to both vendors, and the purchasing entity can decide on its own where to purchase based on the
best available pricing. An award in this fashion allows the purchasing entity to leverage the bid
results and purchase fuel at the lowest cost, depending on the order placed. Also, in the event of
an emergency, MITN cooperative members will have two truck transport vendors available.

Petroleum Traders is a new vendor. However, it uses local carriers for delivery, including RKA
Petroleum and Atlas Oil. Lastly, Petroleum Traders offers 4 0.005 pet gallon reduction for Net 10
payment. RKA offers the same discount for Net 15.
Bid factor pricing for truck transport by the successful vendors follows below:
Petroleum Traders, Inc., 7120 Pointe Inverness Way, Fort Wayne, IN 46804:

Unleaded Regular $0.0078/gal Unleaded Premium $0.0025/gal

Unleaded Mid-Grade $0.0030/gal ULS Diesel #1 $0.0168/gal
ULS Premium Diesel #2 $0.0307/gal Biodiesel B-5 $0.0554/gal



ULS Diesel #2 $0.0107gal Biodiesel B-10 $0.0554/gal
Biodiesel B-20 $0.0554/gal
E85 Ethanol $0.0283/gal

RKA Petroleum Companies, Inc., 28340 Wick Road, Romulus, MI 48174:

Unleaded Regular $0.0102/gal Unleaded Premium  $0.0363/gal
Unleaded Mid-Grade $0.0210/gal ULS Diesel #1 $0.0168/gal
ULS Premium Diesel #2 $0.0200/gal - Biodiesel B-5 $0.0167/gal
ULS Diesel #2 $0.0027/gal Biodiesel B-10 $-0.0027/gal
‘ Biodiesel B-20 $-0.0198/gal

E85 Ethanol N/B

Tank Wagon (deliveries of less than 5000 gallons): The recommendation is to award to Atlas
Oil, the low overall bidder. Its pricing is slightly lower (0.41%) than the incumbent RKA
Petroleum. The minimum load is 200 gallons, before additional delivery charges apply. Atlas
was a vendor under this contract from 2003 to 2007 and there were no reported problems during
that period. One bidder, Michigan Fuels, was the lowest bidder for the tank wagon deliveries
based on the delivery factor bid; however, its minimum delivery was 1,000 gallons. This vendor
also failed to bid on unleaded midgrade gasoline, which eliminated its bid from further
consideration.

Bid factor pricing for tank wagon transport by the successful vendor follows:

Atlas Oil Company, 24501 Ecorse Rd., Taylor, M1, 48180

Unleaded Regular $0.1100/gal ULS Diesel #1 Dyed  $0.0000/gal
Unleaded Mid-Grade $0.1100/gal Biodiesel B-5 $0.0000/gal
ULS Premium Diesel #2 $0.1100/gal Biodiesel B-10 $0.0000/gal
ULS Diesel #2 $0.1100/gal Biodiesel B-20 $0.0000/gal
ULS Diesel #2 Dyed $0.1100/gal E85 Ethanol N/B

MITN cooperative members purchase approximately three million gallons of gasoline and one
million gallons of diesel fuel annually. MITN cooperative members include the govermmental
entities of Birmingham, Eastpointe, Farmington Hills, Grosse Pointe Woods, Livonia, Madison
Heights, Novi, Oakland County, Rochester Hills, Royal Oak, St. Clair Shores, Southfield, Sterling
Heights, Troy, Warren, Waterford, West Bloomfield and Westland. In addition, there are
approximately 4-5 additional entities that may be included at a later date.

All vendors receiving an award must agree to indemnify and hold the MITN cooperative members
harmless from lability and provide evidence of insurance with acceptable terms and coverage.

STAFF RECOMMENDATION:

Please see thé suggested action on the Agenda Statement.



NOTIFICATION LIST

Petroleum Traders, Inc.
7120 Pointe Inverness Way
Fort Wayne, IN 46804

RKA Petroleum Companies
28340 Wick Rd.
Romulus, MI 48174

Atlas Oil Company
24501 Ecorse Rd.
Taylor, MI 48180



BID FORM OR/G/NAL

The undersigned hereby declares that the instructions and specifications have been
carefully examined and that TRUCK TRANSPORT AND TANK WAGON DELIVERIES OF
LEADED AND UNLEADED GASOLINE, AND DIESEL FUEL will be furnished for the
prices set forth in this bid. It is understood and agreed that all bids are F.O.B.
DESTINATION and shall remain in effect for at least ninety (90) days from the date of the
bid opening to allow for award of bid. Unit prices and factors prevail and the cooperative
will correct extension errors,

Bid prices shall remain firm through the two-year contract beginning on February 1, 2012
and any extension options that may be carried out.

Enclose the written policy you have in place for times of disaster or declared
emergencies.

List 24/7 emergency contact and number; Dispatch Department, 800-348-3705 option 1

Indicate split order charges, if any: $40f00

Indicate if payment by a Purchasing Card is acceptable: Yes

List Cards Accepted; _Master Card and Visa, all invoices pald via credit card will be asses a 4.5% processing fee

How did you receive netification of this bid? MITN

" How did you obtaln the bid specifications? If bid documents were downloaded from a
website, please list: _MITN's website

COMPANY _Petroleumn Traders Corporation

ADDRESS 7120 Pointe Inverness Way

CITY/STATE/zZ/p_Fort Wayne, IN 46804

REPRESENTATIVE/TITLE_Gayle Newton, Contract Sales Mah‘ager

PHONE/FAX__P:800-348-3705x1002 / F:260-207-6347

REALISTIC DELIVERY TIME IN HOURS_ 24 hours

TERMS_ Net 30, No discount / Net 10, .0050 / gallon discount

EMAIL ADDRESS/MWEBSITE gnewton@petréleumtraders.com ! www petroleumtraders,com

SIGNATURE Mw DATE_10/28/2011

Gayie Newzon, Contract Sales Manager

Official bid specifications are available only at www.mitn.info or call the Office of Bid Form
Purchasing at 586-446-2740. Page 1




BID FORM — TRUCK TRANSPORT

Est. Usage™ Average * Price/gallon Ext. Total#
Unleaded 2,505 pod 24000 $ 26822 +.0078 $ 26900 $-6:564736 6,133,199. 50
Unleaded Mid-Grade 434,000 . § 2.7486 . +.0030 $ 27516 $ 1,194,194 40
Unleaded Premium 1,000 $_2.8994 +.0025 $_2.9019 $ 2,901.90
ULS Diesel #1 1,000 $_3.4001 40168 $ 3.4169 $ 3,416.90
ULS Premium Diesel #2 428005 362.600- $ 3.2108 +.0307 $ 3.2415 $-H173:42% 1,387 362,00
ULS Diesel #2 657,000 $ 3.1706 +.0107 $ 3.1813 $ 2,090,114.10
Biodiesel B-5 (Optional) 1,000 $_3.1706 +.0431 $ 3.2137 $ 3,213.70
Biodiesel B-10 (Optional) 1,000 $_3.1708 +.0431 $_ 3.2137 $ 3,213.70
Biodiese] B-20 (Optional) 1,000 $ -3.1706 +.0431 $ 32137 $ 3,213.70
E85 Ethanol (Optional) 1,000 2.5204 +.0283 $ 25487 Totak ~ $_2548.70

Grand Total:  § 10.077.07640-1h 12336310

Please base pricing on minimum delivery of 8,000 gallons per drop. Indicate any short load charges for quantities between 5,000 and 8.000
gallons.

Short load charge, if any: $50.00

1. Identify all sources of supply: _Various to Include: Valero, Shell, BP, Sunocao, efc.

2. Approximate annual volume in gallons, in Southeast Michigan: _3.179,000

* Estimated yearly product usage of cooperative in gallons
# Extended total is calculated by mulfiplying estimated yearly product usage by price per gallon

Official bid specifications are available only at wiww.mitn.info or call the Office of Purchasing at 586-446-2740. Bid Form, Page 2



BID FORM — TANK WAGON

Est. Usage* Average » + Price/galion Ext. Total#

Unleaded . 31,000 $ NO BID $_ $
Unleaded Mid-Grade 40,000 $ NO BID $ $
ULS Premium Diesel #2 19,000 $ NO BID $ $
ULS Diesel #2 85,000 $ NO BID 3 $
ULS Dyed Diesel #2 51,500 $ NO BID $ 3
ULS Dyed Diesel #1 200 |

Biodiesel B-5 (Optional) 1,000 $ NO BID $ 5
Biodiesel B-10 (Optional) 1,000 $ ' NO BID $ . 3
Biodiesel B-20 (Optional) 1,000 $ NOBID S $
E85 Ethanol (Optional) 1,000 - Total: $

The term "tank wagon" is intended to describe delivery in lots of 5,000 or less. Please specify minimum delivery quantity: _NO BID

1. ldentify all sources of supply: NO BID

2. Approximate annual volume in gallons, in Southeast Michigan: NO BID

* Estimated yearly product usage of cooperative in gallons
¥ Exfended total is calculated by multiplying esfimated yearly product usage by price per galfon

Official bid specifications are available only at www.mitn.info or call the Office of Purchasing at 586-446-2740. Bid Form, Page 3



- HOLD HARMLESS AND INDEMNITY

To the fullest extent permitted by law, the contractor expressly agrees fo indemnify and
hold the City of Sterling Heights (City), its elected and appointed officials, employees and
volunteer and others working on behalf of the City, harmless from and against all loss, cost,
expense, damage, liability or claims, whether groundless or not, arising out of the bodily
injury, sickness or disease (including death resulting at any time therefrom) which may be
sustained or claimed by any person or persons, or the damage or destruction of any
property, including the loss of use thereof, based on any act or omission, negligent or
otherwise, of contractor or anyone acting in its behalf in connection with or incident to this
contract or the wark to be performed hereunder, except that the centractor shall not be
responsible to the City on indemnity for damages caused by or resulting from the City's
sole negligence; and the Contractor shall, at its own cost and expense, defend any such
claim and any suit, action, or proceeding which may be commenced hereunder, and the
Contractor shall pay any and all judgments which may be recovered in any such suit,
action or proceeding, and any and all expense, including, but not limited to, costs,
attorneys' fees and settlement expenses which may be incurred therein.

PLEASE PRINT:

CONTRACTOR NAME__Petroleum Traders Corporation

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE Gayle Newton, Contract Sales Manager

SIGNATURE %’mah M}Q\?\

L4

CONTRACTOR ADDRESS_ 7120 Pointe Inverness Way

CITY/STATE/ZIP Fort Wayne, [N 46804
PHONE 800-348-3705x1002

E-MAIL__ghewlton@petroleumtraders.com

WITNESS ﬂnaéw S AReue.

Andrew E. Busch

DATE__10/28/2011

This form must be completed and returned with your bid.

Officlal bid speéif/'cations are avallable only at www.miin.info or call the Office of Purchasing at 586-446-2740



****REVISED Rkek
BID FORM

The undersigned hereby declares that the instructions and specifications have been
carefully examined and that TRUCK TRANSPORT AND TANK WAGON DELIVERIES
OF LEADED AND UNLEADED GASOLINE, AND DIESEL FUEL will be furnished for the
prices set forth in this bid. It is understood and agreed that all bids are F.O.B.
DESTINATION and shall remain in effect for at least ninety (90) days from the date of the
bid opening to allow for award of bid. Unit prices and factors prevail and the cooperative
will correct extension errors. .

Bid prices shall remain firm through the two-year contract beginning on February 1, 2012
and any extension options that may be carried out.

Enclose the written policy you have in place for tlmes of dlsaster or declared emergencies.

L?wma ey L 0.2,
List 24/7 emergency contact and number: M2 205, OQF‘] "7

Indicate split order charges, if any:_ * 25, 00

Indlcate if payment by a Purchasing Card is acceptabie: \—Yé bt a 5/, DILCELS\N A

\

f/ LS qppb\j
List Cards Accepted: \/l <ol W\Ll“:%rfuﬁ*l :D\SCN’U’ 4'4 Areericon EApresg,

How did you receive notification of this bid? ___ M ‘TN

How did you obtain the bid specifications? If bid documents were downloaded from a
website, please list: M\

COMPANY ’RV.(% prealedim Compantes, Ine .
ADDRESS ARBIO 1w v Read
CITY/STATE/ZIP Pomulae, My 431174
Ches-hmet, Nessez. 2{; Rk Enelghet
REPRESENTATIVE/TITLE God Peck Cxec Pyeaeyr
C%LH ctbio AADS (724) Olklsr 249

PHONE/FAX (128 1. 22055
REALISTIC DELIVERY'{IM IN HOURS a

&ﬂﬁ((r L O09 OP9
TERMS Jﬂ Y20 oe N \D W/ prompt w\; Dsemont

EMAIL ADDRESS/WEBSITE_D\s & ckapehole um, 0onm

SIGNATURE \L : DATE |0 2%

Official bid specifications are available anly at www. m/tn /nfo or call the Office of Revised Bid Form
Purchasing at 586-446-2740. Page 1



**REVISED***

BID FORM -- TRUCK TRANSPORT

Est. Usage* Average - + Price/gallon Ext. Total#

Unleaded 2,505,000 $.0.757 +. 010 s 2T 73 809248805

Unleaded Mid-Grade 434,000 s.2.8257 20310 s )4 s [ J35 56780

Unleaded Premium 1000 s.7 9743 #0363 $ 3.0/0k s 3010 60

ULS Diesel #1 1,000 s 349498 7.0168 $. 3.5/  $_35/[.40

ULS Premium Diesel #2 428,000 s 39940 +,0 300 $ 3.30485 s 1Y UL

ULS Diesel #2 657,000 s 3, 5449 7,007 $ 3.94595  $.2/32293.50
_ Biodiesel B-5 (Optional) 1,000 $ 32049 D17 $ 3377 s 3373 &0

Biodiesel B-10 (Optional) 1,000 $_ 3. 3718 -, 0047 $ 3 3GA3 s 33¢8.30

Biodiesel B-20 (Optional) 1,000 $ 3,499 -, 0198 $ 3 4794 s 3479.46

E85 Ethanol (Optional) ¥ 1,000 ¥ Available cpor f’%?‘mfsf : Total:  $_/1, 73/ 509.36

Please base pricing on minimum delivery of 8,000 gallons per drop. Indicate any short load charges for quantities between 5,000 and

8.000 gallons.
‘ 60
Short load charge, if any: ﬁ@, -~

7 . / o -3 P S » )
1. Identify all sources of supply: /7//01’*’5% Zhon s [1 #@@; 7‘7’{42%{/ o c_ga//&’CO ; 5? (,734/ W Cée’,// and’
Jilorid L [ 7 7 7 '
2. Approximate annual volume in galfons, in Southeast Michigan: qq .'979)),. ) EJ)Q,U tO.mQ ~ APPRLA MTE

ToTecl

* Estimated yearly product usage of cooperative in gallons
# Extended fotal is caicufated by multiplying estimated yearly product usage by price per galion

Official bid specifications are available only at www.mitn.info or call the Office of Revised Bid Form
Purchasing at 586-446-2740. Page 2

RKEA



REVISED**

BID FORM —- TANK WAGON
Est. Usage* Average + Price/galion Ext. Total#

Unleaded 47,500 $o/. 757/ +. /195 s LB 766 $ /3003550

Unleaded Mid-Grade 40,000 $ 28357 DT $ 7 9452 s /) 7508, #

ULS Premium Diesel #2 22,500 $_§ﬁ3@@ 7. 1195 $ 34055 $ Tty 3 75

ULS Diesel #2 77.000 s 3.9478 +, IS5 $ 32073 $A98697,4

ULS Dyed Diesel #2 39,500 s 39473/ + /95§ 336N 54347832
* ULS Dyed Diesel #1 200 * ** G750 '

Biodiesel B-5 (Optional) 1,000 s 43069  +.)31D s 34379 s 3Y37 90

Biodiese! B-10 (Optional) 1,000 $3.%710 + /5 $ 398525 s 3484.50
Biodiesel B-20 (Optional) 1,000 $ 3.4992 + 0960 $ 3.5954 s 3595,30
E85 Ethanol (Optional) # 1,000 xAvailasle zpon F"é’j’é{é':if. - rotat $_7 350 /5

The term "tank wagon" is intended to describe delivery in lots of 5,000 or less. Please specxfy mlmmum dellvery quantity:

/A0 o«’la///ﬁ& I under /%“0@@//(/7( g BN agdiAing S Cbavne 20

J ey
1. Identify all sources of supply: /7 / G 7140/7 /:'74;“4 5//ZJ VAV / \ﬂ/ﬁc" CO Efj ﬁ b / \5//?6_/ / c?/’l(/ ’
Winrld £ i €15 .
2. Approximate annual volume in gallons, in Southeast Michigan: C{CL'B)g i{. Ugs L}Cl_u NS - APPReAIMATE

ToiAL

* Estimated yearly product usage of cooperative in gafions
# Extended fofal is calculated by multiplying estimated yearly product usage by price per gallon

Official bid specifications are available only af www.mitn.info or call the Office of Revised Bid Form
Purchasing at 586-446-2740. , : Page 3 R E p(



HOLD HARMLESS AND INDEMNITY

To the fullest extent permitted by law, the contractor expressly agrees to indemnify and
hold the City of Sterling Heights (City), its elected and appointed officials, employees and
volunteer and others working on behalf of the City, harmiess from and against all loss, cost,
expense, damage, liability or claims, whether groundless or not, arising out of the bodily
injury, sickness or disease (including death resulting at any time therefrom) which may be
sustained or claimed by any person or persons, or the damage or destruction of any
property, including the loss of use thereof, based on any act or omission, negligent or
otherwise, of contractor or anyone acting in its behalf in connection with or incident to this
contract or the work to be performed hereunder, except that the contractor shall not be
responsible to the City on indemnity for damages caused by or resulting from the City's
sole negdligence; and the Contractor shall, at its own cost and expense, defend any such
claim and any suit, action, or proceeding which may be commenced hereunder, and the
Contractor shall pay any and all judgments which may be recovered in any such suit,
action or proceeding, and any and all expense, including, but not limited to, costs,
attorneys' fees and settlement expenses which may be incurred therein.

PLEASE PRINT:

CONTRACTOR NAME__R¥A Yerpolewim Companies, ne

AUTHORIZED REPRES\EQTATN Rick (——v—,QIC\IAJ\"

SIGNATURE

' CONTRACTOR ADDRESS ?\%?;Ll—o e ¥, Ra.

CITY/STATE/ZIP Powmulue My 4R 17
PHONE (124) auw 2235

E-MAIL bids @ via pehyolenm Corm
WITNESS Mpdoes ) W ewn o)

DATE 1O 2% - U

This form must be completed and returned with your bid.

Official bid specifications are available only at www.mmitn.infq or call the Office of Purchasing at 586-446-2740



*REVISED***
BID FORM

The undersigned hereby declares that the instructions and specifications have been
carefully examined and that TRUCK TRANSPORT AND TANK WAGON DELIVERIES
OF LEADED AND UNLEADED GASOLINE, AND DIESEL FUEL will be furnished for the
prices set forth in this bid. It is understood and agreed that all bids are F.O.B.
DESTINATION and shall remain in effect for at least ninety (90) days from the date of the
bid opening to allow for award of bid. Unit prices and factors prevall and the. cooperative
will correct extension errors.

Bid prices shall remain firm through the two-year contract beginning on February 1, 20121
and any extension options that may be carried out,

Enclose the wntten policy you have in place for tn&i of dlsaster or declared emergencies.
a.y\ 2 /"(,\ ho cntoud

List 24/7 emergency contact and number: 530204129 o OO ¢1 4 ZooDd ¢
liske ~ o prampts Sof on Call dispedon - N 20
Indicate split order charges, if any: 55

Indicate if payment by a Purchasing Card is acceptable: N/ A
List Cards Aécepted: N/ /3o

How did you receive notification of this bid? MITN  Webs e

How did you obtain the bid specifications? If bid documents were downloaded from a
website, please list: t/\L\l\!\A{%O\/b s . Comn

company__ Aty Ot S
ADDRESS__ 2450l Frerse

CITY/STATE/ZIP T&L{ e ML ABIED
REPRESENTATIVETITLE_b Ken Yioe: Eve Qe | Bue Dev.
PHONE/FAXO\ 2% b@Z 5‘:%4 5\ 21344 7] 2000
REALISTIC DELIVERY TIME IN HOURS_wbhin  2H hsuee

TERMS Majr 70
EMAIL ADDRESSWEBSITE_ww . gHasor | . Con~

SIGNATURE fide Lz DATE__jofot/ I
Official bid speciﬁc% are available only at www.mitn.info or call the Office of Revised Bid Form

Purchasing at 586-446-2740. Page 1



Est. Usage* Average + Price/gallon Ext. Total#
Unleaded 2,505,000 $ 2.LBO| -+, 0255 s 2. 1056 $ LTI 5162
Unleaded Mid-Grade 434,000 $_ ARG +. 035 $_2A.T72 3. A (ﬁ ‘*D
Unleaded Premium 1,000 s 2.9/ = s 29994 $ - Y,
ULS Diesel #1 1,000 $_ k. 504t = $_A. Hod% $ ;5@3& gO
ULS Premium Diesel #2 428,000 $ DAIBT +, CA59 $_ A, 5K $ \DL,HUL. L
ULS Diesel #2 657.000 $ 4. +, ca9 $ 2. X702 s g 587 'e
Biodiesel B-5 (Optional) 1,000 $ A IS & $ 2.1915 $ 3141, 50
Biodiesel B-10 (Optional) 1,000 $H. 2% HA £ s 2.2234] $_ 3022, 4o
Biodiesel B-20 (Optional) 1,000 5.2 09719 N a $ >.0979 $ 2097 99
E85 Ethanol (Optional) 1,000 NO BiD . Vo 3w Tota 31152 G, P

**REVISED***

BID FORM -- TRUCK TRANSPORT

Please base pricing on minimum delivery of 8,000 gallons per drop.

8.000 gallons.
Short load charge, if any:

b 56 a0

Indicate any short load charges for quantities between 5,000 and

1. Identify all sources of supply: Macatheon _ H \;skalf S[vneco _ &< e L %UGkC:)CLE.n ?/P'%f ] SL\(‘L‘( \/n /16{:0_ P’ o1

200 000, COoUy

2. Approximate annual volume in gallons, in Southeast Michigan:

* Estimated yeary product usage of cooperative in gallons '
# Extended total is calculated by multiplying estimated yearly product usage by price per gallon

Revised Bid Form
Page 2

Official bid specifications are available only at www.mitn.info or call the Office of
Purchasing at 586-446-2740.



~REVISED***

BID FORM - TANK WAGON
Est. Usage* Average + Price/gallon Ext. Total#

Unleaded 47,500 $_R 5ol +. 1100 $_ 21901 R YARYA =
Unleaded Mid-Grade 40,000 $_ 271480 + 1100 $_NF5%0L $ || 4DHy, P
ULS Premium Diesel #2 22,500 $ A.A1R7 .00 $.5.52%57 $_ 14153 }5
ULS Diesel #2 77,000 $_ A pild +, 110 $_D. 25 $ 2K Q@&‘:‘.‘/)
ULS Dyed Diesel #2 39,500 $ 3. 1%ol + ( $_ 5. A0\ $ 129 5% 1=
ULS Dyed Diesel #1 200 _ 54282 - 5.42%82. BN nRca
Biodiesel B-5 (Optional) 1,000 s A5 o $ D95 $.300 ,=22
Biodiesel B-10 (Optional) 1,000 g D% = $_ A 7*H 24 $ D237 =
Biodiesel B-20 (Optional) 1,000 $ 5.OCI'7O\ Jou i -3 A.879Y $ DY Zq—Q
E85 Ethanol (Optional) 1000 No B NN Tota  $ 120113 1

The term "tank wagon" is intended to describe delivery in lots of 5,000 or less. Please specify minimum delivery quantity:

200 %\a(\oms

1. [dentify all sources of supply:

2. Approximate annual volume in gallons, in Southeast Michigan: 200 . o0 000

* Estimated yearly product usage of cooperative in gallons
# Extended ftotal is calculated by mulliplying estimated yearly product usage by price per gallon

Official bid specifications are available only at www.mitn.info or call the Office of Revised Bid Form
Furchasing af 586-446-2740. . Page 3



HOLD HARMLESS AND INDEMNITY

To the fullest extent permitted by law, the contractor expressly agrees to indemnify and
hold the City of Sterling Heights (City), its elected and appointed officials, employees and
volunteer and others working on behalf of the City, harmless from and against all loss, cost,
expense, damage, liability or claims, whether groundless or not,.arising out of the bodily
injury, sickness or disease (including death resulting at any time therefrom) which may be
sustained or claimed by any person or persons, or the damage or destruction of any
property, including the loss of use thereof, based on any act or omission, negligent or
otherwise, of contractor or anyone acting in its behalf in connection with or incident to this
contract or the work to be performed hereunder, except that the contractor shall not be
responsible to the City on indemnity for damages caused by or resulting from the City's
sole negligence; and the Contractor shall, at its own cost and expense, defend any such
claim and any suit, action, or proceeding which may be commenced hereunder, and the
Contractor shall pay any and all judgments which may be recovered in any such suit,
action or proceeding, and any and all expense, including, but not limited to, costs,
attorneys' fees and settlement expenses which may be incurred therein.

PLEASE PRINT:

conTRACTORNAVE__ Attlas ()| CO"Y‘{OGI\;/
AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE Pl Ke Ny O
sionATURE Arter (e —

CONTRACTO/RA ess_24%0f Ecorse
CITY/STATE/ZIP Tc:j(mrl ML 48180
PHONE__D\5 - (L2 5594

el Sandp ¢@ oflacor]. com

WITNESS_ Demed Q@/ {’\o-c vl m,cfc/
" DATE ""/ 5‘/ \

This form must be completed and returned with your bid.

Official bid specifications are available only at www.mitn.infa or call the Office of Purchasing at 586-446-2740
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